Hi Tom!

I am just looking for 1 dancer reimbursement for NECC. Fran told me this email from Joy would work as a copy of my registration and proof of payment. Thank you!

Best,
Sam Regan
---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: JOY DENIS <nhjoy@msn.com>
Date: Mon, Dec 13, 2021 at 11:40 AM
Subject: NECC 2022
To: Samantha Leahon <srleahon@gmail.com>


This is to confirm your registration to NECC 2022 for 1 dancer and 1 spectator, $60.00 paid.  Please email if you have any questions or need to make any changes.  Happy holidays and see you soon !
Joy

Sent from my iPad
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